e RETT

BRTITON [FLIXCTH
C)?)’ew O BE)B

PN -V D Forsed, AreshaRs, OF, W3t 9090 ( 830k , 92, FEI@F 0FLD) 30. 926
Part-IVA BENGALURU, MONDAY, 19, OCTOBER, 2020 ( ASHWAYUJA, 27, SHAKAVARSHA, 1942) No. 478

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION

NO.DPAL 09 SHASHANA 2020, BENGALURU, DATED: 19.10.2020

Ordered that the translation of the Karnataka Race Courses Licensing
(Amendment) Act, 2020 (Karnataka Act 23 of 2020) in Kannada language, be
published as authorised by the Governor of the Karnataka under section 5-A of
the Karnataka official language Act, 1963 in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-

ordinary for general Information.

The following translation of the Karnataka Race Courses Licensing
(Amendment) Act, 2020 (Karnataka Act 23 of 2020) in Kannada language, is
published in the Official Gazette under the authority of the Governor of Karnataka
under section 5-A of the Karnataka official language Act 1963.

KARNATAKA ACT NO.23 OF 2020
(First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 19th Day of
October 2020)

THE KARNATAKA RACE COURSES LICENSING (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2020
(Received the assent of the Governor on the 19t day of October 2020)

A Act further to amend the Karnataka Race Courses Licensing Act, 1952.

@)



Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Race Courses
Licensing Act, 1952 (Karnataka Act VIII of 1952) for the purposes hereinafter
appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy first year of

the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Race Courses Licensing (Amendment) Act, 2020.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of sections 4.- In the Karnataka Race Courses Licensing
Act, 1952 (Karnataka Act VIII of 1952) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act),
in section 4, after the word “Government”, wherever it occurs, the words “or the
officer authorised by the Government” shall be inserted.

3. Amendment of section 5.- In section of 5 of the Principal Act, for the
words “five hundred rupees”, the words “fifty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.

4. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the Principal Act, for the words
“one thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 7.- In section 7 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1),-

(@) after the word “Government”, the words “or the officer
authorised by the Government” shall be inserted; and

(b) for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh
rupees” shall be substituted,;

(ii) in sub-section (2),-

(@) after the word “Government”, the words “or the officer
authorised by the Government” shall be inserted; and
(b) for the word “one thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh

rupees” shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 8 - In section 8 of the Principal Act, after the
word “Government”, the words “or the officer authorised by the Government” shall

be inserted.



7. Amendment of section 9 - In section 9 of the Principal Act in sub-section
(1) after the word “Government”, the words “or the officer authorised by the

Government” shall be inserted

By Order and in the name of
the Governor of Karnataka,

(K. DWARAKANATA BABU)
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary Affairs
and Legislation

TOXDCOD B ;W TONSH DI, TOIN OWS IWToOod
ODIRWII
T08ls: FOIsToY 09 TS 2020, WonLeD), DT03:19.10.2020

Tooe&dT BR* BRCRIENPN @WToN DS IR0, 19523y, (19523
TOOEET 9PIOND VNI D3R, 3TV B e300RBEN 2,083 DA BEWT, 2020
0 ©930,L00° 30NE 19 3 DJV0TWOR ToZsatoDT Wwad),i BRTIT), A0S
3PEBPTMON VWY, 2020 T TUEET 9RNAONTD AODBs: 23 0N T Eds
Doty BIWC), yTEIRWEFTOD 3IF NG,

2020 3 FooF&% 9DAODD Joals: 23
FooFrédT BCABRCRFNINR ITToSN ACRIE (3T RD) L9RDDOHD, 2020

(2020 B £98.6,£20° 0¥ 19 &5t DVVOTTOR) FTOEEIT Tots;BIT TR FOLTADE), TBOTEN
BBE3TON)

BooE6)T OCR® BRERIENDN BTN DeBIe3 900N, 1952, IR,
3T B 23T 20T LIPON.

Q). YREN0T FOWIWTVE VB EINPMON Tooe&dT BCA* TRCRIENDR
BTSN LTI IPODED, 195230, (19528 ToeedT 9PN V) DI eR),,
3T B 20T ONT200NTIe)BOOTT;

QTD, P03 NPT B BROWIE  BREWE).  FTooe&dd  Tosg
ROV OTBORNOT T3 eV0RNTOIZ IR ORI ZONE), DOTT:-



1. FOZW, VI DI, TYTOYW.- (1) B BPRIADTNTI),; TOEET
A BRCRIENDT BTN LTI (STVFIE) LR, 2020 DOT FTCNIT,ED,.

(2) VR &8 TRTWSE 22001 T3T,T,.

2. 43¢ RTOT W RBVB.- Toor&dT BA* TRCRIENPT BTSN LTI
9RO, 19528 (19528 TooeedT 9RDRIOND VII) (V). BRz3000T a0
eIRNAIODNWOT) N3 LDFTNT) 43¢ RBTTOWE), “ATOEFT' Q0W BT
WAHVBRFS 9. €3 BEE 3BI000 9GP0 ATOETad) LPTHINRPAT 9QTD"
N0 BWNP, JYNE 330N L 0NN ALDRIT,R),.

3. 583¢ RTFOETW W JBR.- DR LIRIDRDT 53¢ RyFTLTE). 80T
SPTD BRTIANNLNR" 020 WEWNRPNR 808330, AT CRTVICNNLPN" 02 BWNP,
B33 RCBRITR,,.

4. 630 RVFTOPTW ST JBR.- DR LIRICNTNT 63 TyTTLRE). 20T
20T CRETIAINPNR" 0L JWNPNR 20T OF SRTICNPR" 02 BBNRPR,
33 RCBRIT,,.

5. 783¢ &,F00T 3T BR.- 20RO LIRDIONTDT 73 BFTLTE)_,-

(i) (1) IVIT3T),,-

(X)) "ATIETR) DN0W BBEW 3B0e00D I AT Teg) L9IRTNRRP AT
9IRDTODAZN" R0 BWNF D, ACDRIT,T),,; 03I,

() "2u0T) AT CRETIAINPNR" 02 BWNRAPR 2,000 OF BRTWONRLR"
D02 BWNP, &)3O3RCRRIT,,,.

(i) ()¢ VBT TTLT),, -

(X)) "ATIETR)’ D0W BBEW 3B000D I AT Teg) L9IRTNRRP AT
9RDTODAN" D02 BWNFI, ALDRIT,T3),,; 03I,

() "2u0T) AT CRETIOINPNR" 020 BWNRAPR 20030 OF BRTWONRLRH"
N0 BBNFI, 33 CR 3T,

6. 8:3¢ BTVTW STWHBR.- 2R 9PN 83 WyFTTC). AT T
D0 BVWE 3TV e9T3eI0 ATOE TVeg) LIPTZRR PRI LIPTIDORN" 02
BTNFI), AADRITT,.



R.N.I. No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297

7. 93¢ RWyTORTW STWIJ/R.- DRO LRIRNDT I IJF3T  (1)3€
NBITOORE), “ATFTT' DN0W BDIE IR0 9T ATIE T

ORDTYNRPP RIS L9IDTIDOD"” 0 WRNFI), ADRIT,,,.

The above translation of Karnataka Race Courses Licensing (Amendment)
Act, 2020.(Karnataka Act 23 of 2020) shall be authoritative text in the Kannada
language under section 5-A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963
(Karnataka Act 26 of 1963).

2023900 OO
FTOOEEIT Dot OT)

FEET DR300 e3TT RO AT
2N3I), 93T BROIC),

(F.090,0F005° W)
RFOE VT ToONETIE
RORRLAD 235e3Ta0CNEDH aNIY,
DOAS BB 90B.

BBBD Tarie BBoBBTx:- FOBUTRZONW, BIFEIB ToR B3, IBord Beos, dngjmevad, eorited

SUNIL GARDE




		2020-10-20T17:21:01+0530
	SUNIL GARDE




