
fof/k foHkkx 
 

vf/klwpuk 
 

f'keyk&2] 14 Qjojh] 2022 
 
 la[;k% ,y0,y0vkj0&Mh0¼6½&11@2020&yst-&Hkkjr ds jk"Vªifr us Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 
201 ds v/khu iznRr 'kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq, vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2020 
¼2020 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 5½  dks fnukad  25&12&2021 dks vuqeksfnr dj fn;k gS rFkk fgekpy izns'k 
ds jkT;iky us Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 348 ds [k.M ¼3½ ds v/khu fo/ks;d ds vaxzsth ikB dks 
jkti=] fgekpy izns'k esa izdkf'kr djus ds fy, izkf/kÑr dj fn;k gSA vr% mijksDr fo/ks;d dks o"kZ 
2022 ds vf/kfu;e la[;kad 5 ds :i esa vaxzsth izkf/kÑr ikB lfgr jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½ fgekpy izns'k esa 
izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gSA 
 

vksn'k }kjk] 
 jktho Hkkj}kt] 

iz/kku lfpo ¼fof/k½A 
 

&&&&&&&& 
 

vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2020 
 

/kkjkvksa dk Øe 
 

/kkjk % 
 1- laf{kIr uke vkSj izkjEHkA 
 2- /kkjk 22 dk la”kks/kuA 
 3- /kkjk 25p dk la”kks/kuA 
 4- /kkjk 25V dk la”kks/kuA 
 5- 2020 ds fgekpy izns”k v/;kns”k la[;kad 4 dk fujlu vkSj O;ko`fRr;kaA 
 

&&&&&&  
2022 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 5 

 
vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2020 

 
¼ekuuh; jk"Vªifr egksn; }kjk rkjh[k 25 fnlEcj] 2021 dks ;Fkkvuqeksfnr½ 

 
 fgekpy izns”k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw vkS|ksfxd fookn vf/kfu;e] 1947 ¼1947 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 
14½ dk la”kks/ku djus ds fy, vf/kfu;eA 
 
 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds bdgRrjosa o"kZ esa fgekpy izns”k fo/kku lHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks %&& 
 
 1- laf{kIr uke vkSj izkjEHk-&&¼1½  bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke  vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy 
izns”k la”kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2020 gSA 
 
 ¼2½  ;g 9 tqykbZ] 2020 ls izo`Ùk gqvk le>k tk,xkA 
 



 2- /kkjk 22 dk Lak”kks/ku-&&fgekpy izns'k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw vkS|ksfxd fookn vf/kfu;e] 1947 
¼1947 dk 14½ ¼ftls blesa blds i'pkr~ ßewy vf/kfu;eß dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 22 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ vkSj 
¼2½ esa] ßyksd mi;ksxh lsokß “kCnksa ds i”pkr~ ßvkSj xSj&yksd mi;ksxh lsokß “kCn vUr%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 
 
 3- /kkjk 25p dk Lak”kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 25p ds [k.M ¼[k½ esa] ^^ianzg fnuß 'kCnksa ds 
LFkku ij ^^lkB fnu** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 4- /kkjk 25V dk Lak”kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 25V dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa] **,d lkS** 'kCnksa ds 
LFkku ij **nks lkS** 'kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 5- 2020 ds fgekpy izns'k v/;kns'k la[;kad 4 dk fujlu vkSj O;ko`fRr;ka-&&¼1½ vkS|ksfxd 
fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ v/;kns”k] 2020 dk ,rn~}kjk fujlu fd;k tkrk gSSA 
 
 ¼2½  ,sls fujlu ds gksrs gq, Hkh bl izdkj fujflr v/;kns'k ds v/khu  dh xbZ dksbZ ckr ;k 
dkjZokbZ bl  vf/kfu;e ds rRLFkkuh mica/kksa ds v/khu fof/kekU; :i esa dh xbZ le>h tk,xhA 
 

&&&&&&  
 

AUTHORITATIVE  ENGLISH  TEXT 
 

THE  INDUSTRIAL  DISPUTES  (HIMACHAL  PRADESH  AMENDMENT)  
ACT, 2020 

 
ARRANGEMENT  OF  SECTIONS 

 
Sections : 
 
 1.  Short title and commencement.  
 2.  Amendment of section 22. 
 3.  Amendment of section 25F. 
 4.  Amendment of section 25K. 
 5.  Repeal of the Himachal Pradesh Ordinance No. 4 of 2020 and savings. 
 

_______  
 

Act No. 5 of  2022 
 

THE  INDUSTRIAL  DISPUTES  (HIMACHAL  PRADESH  AMENDMENT)  
ACT,  2020 

 
(AS ASSENTED TO BY THE HON'BLE PRESIDENT ON 25TH

 DECEMBER, 2021) 
 

AN 
 

ACT 
 

 to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Act No. 14 of 1947) in its application to the 
State of Himachal Pradesh. 
 
 BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-first Year of 
the Republic of India as follows :— 



 
 1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Industrial Disputes 
(Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2020. 
 
 (2)  It shall be deemed to have come into force on 9th day of July, 2020. 
 
 2. Amendment of section 22.—In section 22 of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 
1947) in its application to the State of Himachal Pradesh (hereinafter referred to as the “principal 
Act”), in sub-sections (1) and (2),  after the words “public utility service”, the words “and non-
public utility service” shall be inserted. 
 
 3. Amendment of section 25F.—In section 25F of the principal Act, in clause (b), for 
the words “fifteen days”, the words “sixty days” shall be substituted. 
 
 4. Amendment of section 25K.—In section 25K of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
for the words “one hundred”, the words “two hundred” shall be substituted. 
 
 5. Repeal of the Himachal Pradesh Ordinance No. 4 of 2020 and savings.—(1) The 
Industrial Disputes (Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 is hereby repealed. 
 
 (2)  Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the Ordinance 
so repealed, shall be deemed to have been validly done or taken under the corresponding provisions 
of this Act. 


