AaeueT g&ar wod0-40

30 hBIfdss 1941 (2M0)
(X0 =HT 1279) YcHAIl, gegdfaday, 21 AT 2019

fafa faam

CIBSCEI

21 STaFR 2019

o TcToslo-01-13/2018-8351/ce—TfaeR faum Hear g aenuf@ =1 fr=fafag  sifufem,
forg wemfen wgufa feAiw 28 SRR 2019 W Al § g ¥, TEH EN WA-WERU
g & T weifera fRar Smar @

fRR-TSUE & SRy 9
e TR ST,
WHR & Hedl



2 fAgR "o (3MmReT), 21 9NN 2019

(feer srferfe=rT 17, 2019)
tenfre faare (Rer deneq) afdif=E, 2018
tenfre faare aftrfer, 1947 (M 14, 1947) &1 Heneq &3 @ fag siferfras
TRA-TUSE % SfeTd a9 ¥ feer wow faum ded g fefafaa w9 0 9w sifufmfma w0 -

1. dfgm Tm, faar @ uRwi- (1) W dfufem oieife faare (fem werieE)

arfafram, 2018 weT ST TR

(2) zoeT faear €@yl feer T W =Em

(3) 7® & YA # YERW H fafy ¥ wEgw wEm

2. @1 afufEm 14, 1947 ® w2 # deneA -ofwifie faa  eifufwEm,

1947 &t °90-2 w1 €e-(¥) Frafafed g gfaeenfya feam smom -

(w) “wdEr”’ ¥ ofrid § wE UEn eifrd (Rg wfed), 1 fedt sem o s
% fau #rE ITfeh, oTRY, HIE, qehARl, Uihatrw, fafie W wiest s @
fawa dadq & fau foia @, =) faeA & few afversa & o foafa,
IR fFd o faoe & Wow W @ sfufem & oim w1 R wreE @
wee Y wE off wfed i @ S S oA & dew ¥ @ STk qiRomeeeawy
A A IAMGd wX fem Tmen w oW fEwR St w @ O @ ostger St
v, SHER A gedl TRy SH ¥ o® faee s gen w1, fhw sEW W U@
aAfFq wmfra T E -

(i) = w aifufm, 1950 (1950 @1 45) =1 & Afuftd, 1950 (1950 T 46)
1 F erfufEm, 1957 (1957 @1 62) & eremei =l e
(i) 9fee war # =@ fdt FR & Sfel W o= wEER & w9 # frnfea
B, 31efel
(iii) qerd: weusmE A1 genEte efgEd o s e sreren
(iv) waeft ¥fgga & Feifsd e gu wfawe <@ 'R T ¥ sfue werRd o
B YA A Al U8 Y GO wdedl S WHid @ A 9 H fafgq wifeqsr &
HRO TY FA FT TN HEAT B W GO TEHE GHA &
T faReiR wifers,
&R & gfaal

21 Fd¥EX 2019
Yo TeAoSo-01-13/2018-8352/15 foer faumm Hew gR1 Fomqiid R wemien wwgatd gl
fedih 28 STFqER 2019 H A il fyare (feem wwmer) sifufw, 2018 w1 frefafed
HUSt IR foeR UMl % WIfUR W gEe g1 YR fRer W @, e awde d@faue &
T 348 & WE (3) & oA aFq Sifufmm w1 SFSH v H WiftRkd WIS WHeN ST
fRrR-Tsaua & SRy @
e ey wifTs,
&R & gledl
[Bihar Act 17, 2019]
Industrial Disputes (Bihar Amendment) Act, 2018
AN
ACT
To amend The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Act 14 of 1947).
Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Bihar in the sixty nineth year of the Republic
of India as follows :-
1. Short title, extent and commencement.— (1) This Act may be called The Industrial

Disputes (Bihar Amendment) Act, 2018;
(2) It shall extend to the whole of the State of Bihar.



fgR "o (3mTuReT), 21 99N 2019 3

(3) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in official gazette.
2. (2) Amendment of Section 2 Central Act 14 of 1947: Clause (S) of Section 2 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, shall be substituted by the following :-
“(s) ‘workman’ means any person (including an apprentice) employed in any industry

@)
(i)

(iii)
(iv)

to do any manual, unskilled, skilled, technical, operational, clerical or
supervisory work or for the promotion of sales for hire or reward, whether the
terms of employment be express or implied, and for the purposes of any
proceeding under this Act in relation to an industrial dispute, includes any such
person who has been dismissed, discharged or retrenched in connection with, or
as a consequence of, that dispute, or whose dismissal, discharge or retrenchment
has led to that dispute, but does not include any such person -

Who is subject to the Air Force Act, 1950(45 of 1950), or the Army Act, 1950 (46

of 1950), or the Navy Act, 1957 (62 of 1957); or

Who is employed in the police service or as an officer or other employee of a

prison; or

Who is employed mainly in a managerial or administrative capacity; or

Who, being employed in a supervisory capacity, draws wages exceeding ten

thousand rupees per mensem or exercises, either by the nature of the duties

attached to the office or by reason of the powers vested in him, functions mainly

of a managerial nature.

MADAN KISHORE KAUSHIK,
Secretary to Government of Bihar.

3refterd, AfAdTery qsuned,
fagIR, yeAT g1 yabIfarT ve gfadl

fgR TToTe (STATHUIRUN) 1279-571+400 -S10TT0d0|
Website: http://egazette.bih.nic.in




Aaee g&ar wod0-40

27 <pIikip 1942 (2N0)
(0 YeHT 897) USHI, guEIY, 18 AgGF=¥ 2020

fof/k foHkkx

aferger
18 FGrR 2020
Ho TAOS0-01-10/2020/6335/A—I(IBR faum Heel gRT JATaRa &1 fFfefad s,
SR Aemfen Igufa faAid 20 JTFRER 2020 HT AN T b ©, THD §N FAARIRY B Gl &
forr a1l fbam Sim 21

ferR-TTa & ARy 9,
Godoaterd,
TWHR & Fiag |



fagR 57T (SrTYRYT), 18 AgFek 2020 3

18 TIRR 2020

Ho WAOS10-01-10/2020/6336/A9—ToeR foeM Heel g1 I« @R wemfed Tegufd
g fediwm 20 stqeR 2020 w1 osgEad VK| kfxd fookn Ufcgkj Bkkkud vikfuse] 2020 e
frfafad il oaR foerR ToOwa & WIRER W 3Ee g Yeiv R S ®, TN awdE
dfau & ogwR-348 ® W (3) #® oW SFq oAUt w1 SESH W W Wivshd WS wem
SR

fRR-T=Ma & Ry W/,
frodoaterd,
T&ER & gfeal

(BIHAR ACT 15, 2020)
THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES (BIHAR AMENDMENT) ACT, 2020
(An Act further to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947)

Whereas, the Covid-19 pandemic has deteriorated the Industrial and Economic activities in
the State of Bihar and for providing impetus to the Industrial and Economic activities in the State, it
is important to provide new opportunities for Industrial investment in the State;

And whereas, the Governor is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for
him to take immediate action;

And whereas, it has been promulgated as an Ordinance in the light of the instruction
received from the President :

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Bihar in the Seventy First year of the
Republic of India as follows :-

1. Short Title, Extent and Commencement.—

(1) This Act may be called the Industrial Disputes (Bihar Amendment) Act, 2020.
(2) It shall extent to the whole of the State of Bihar
(3) It shall come into force at once.
2. Amendment of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947.—
(1) In the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, in section 25 K, for the words "one hundred",
the words "three hundred" shall be substituted.
(2) In the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, after the sub section 36 (B), the following
section shall be added, namely:-
"36-C (Power to exempt new industries in public interest)- Where the State

Government in satisfied in relation to any new industrial establishment or new

undertaking or class of new industrial establishments or new undertaking that it is

necessary in the public interest to do so, it may, by notification in the official

Gazette, exempt, conditionally or unconditionally, any such new establishment or

new undertaking or class of new establishments or new undertaking from all or any

of the provisions of this Act for a period of one thousand days from the date of the
establishment of such new industrial establishment or new undertaking or class of
new establishments or new undertakings, as the case may be"

Explanation:- For the puposes of this section, the expression "new industrial
establishment or new undertaking or class of new industrial establishment or new
undertakings"means such industrial establihsment or undertaking or class of industrial
establishemnts or undertakings which are established within a period of one thousand days
after the commencement of the Industrial Disputes (Bihar Amendment) Act, 2020.

3. Validation.— Notwithstanding such amendment in section 25 K and the section 36 of the
Act, anything done and decision and action taken prior to it shall be deemed to have been validly
done or taken and shall not be questioned on the ground of amendment of section 25 K and the
section 36 of the Act.



fagR 57T (IrATYReT), 18 dAgF«Y 2020

4. Repeal and Savings.—

)
(i)

The Industrial Disputes (Bihar Amendment) Ordinance, 2020. (Bihar Ordinance
No-07- 2020 is hereby repealed.

Notwithstanding such repeal, any thing done or any action takent in exercise of
any power conferred by or under the said ordinance shall be deemed to have been
done or taken in exercise of the powers conferred by or under this Act as if this
Act were in force on the days on which such thing was done or action taken.

By Order of the Governor of Bihar,
P.C.Choudhary,

Secretary to the Government.

Jrefters, AfAaTerd eomed,
fagIR, yeAT g1 yabIfarT ve gfadl

g TTo1e (IraTeRur) 897-571+400-SH0ET0dio|
Website: http://egazette.bih.nic.in




Aaee g&ar wod0-40

27 <pIikip 1942 (2N0)
(0 YeHT 897) USHI, guEIY, 18 AgGF=¥ 2020

fof/k foHkkx

aferger
18 FGrR 2020
Ho TAOS0-01-10/2020/6335/A—I(IBR faum Heel gRT JATaRa &1 fFfefad s,
SR Aemfen Igufa faAid 20 JTFRER 2020 HT AN T b ©, THD §N FAARIRY B Gl &
forr a1l fbam Sim 21

ferR-TTa & ARy 9,
Godoaterd,
TWHR & Fiag |



fagR 57T (SrTYRYT), 18 AgFek 2020 3

18 TIRR 2020

Ho WAOS10-01-10/2020/6336/A9—ToeR foeM Heel g1 I« @R wemfed Tegufd
g fediwm 20 stqeR 2020 w1 osgEad VK| kfxd fookn Ufcgkj Bkkkud vikfuse] 2020 e
frfafad il oaR foerR ToOwa & WIRER W 3Ee g Yeiv R S ®, TN awdE
dfau & ogwR-348 ® W (3) #® oW SFq oAUt w1 SESH W W Wivshd WS wem
SR

fRR-T=Ma & Ry W/,
frodoaterd,
T&ER & gfeal

(BIHAR ACT 15, 2020)
THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES (BIHAR AMENDMENT) ACT, 2020
(An Act further to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947)

Whereas, the Covid-19 pandemic has deteriorated the Industrial and Economic activities in
the State of Bihar and for providing impetus to the Industrial and Economic activities in the State, it
is important to provide new opportunities for Industrial investment in the State;

And whereas, the Governor is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for
him to take immediate action;

And whereas, it has been promulgated as an Ordinance in the light of the instruction
received from the President :

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Bihar in the Seventy First year of the
Republic of India as follows :-

1. Short Title, Extent and Commencement.—

(1) This Act may be called the Industrial Disputes (Bihar Amendment) Act, 2020.
(2) It shall extent to the whole of the State of Bihar
(3) It shall come into force at once.
2. Amendment of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947.—
(1) In the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, in section 25 K, for the words "one hundred",
the words "three hundred" shall be substituted.
(2) In the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, after the sub section 36 (B), the following
section shall be added, namely:-
"36-C (Power to exempt new industries in public interest)- Where the State

Government in satisfied in relation to any new industrial establishment or new

undertaking or class of new industrial establishments or new undertaking that it is

necessary in the public interest to do so, it may, by notification in the official

Gazette, exempt, conditionally or unconditionally, any such new establishment or

new undertaking or class of new establishments or new undertaking from all or any

of the provisions of this Act for a period of one thousand days from the date of the
establishment of such new industrial establishment or new undertaking or class of
new establishments or new undertakings, as the case may be"

Explanation:- For the puposes of this section, the expression "new industrial
establishment or new undertaking or class of new industrial establishment or new
undertakings"means such industrial establihsment or undertaking or class of industrial
establishemnts or undertakings which are established within a period of one thousand days
after the commencement of the Industrial Disputes (Bihar Amendment) Act, 2020.

3. Validation.— Notwithstanding such amendment in section 25 K and the section 36 of the
Act, anything done and decision and action taken prior to it shall be deemed to have been validly
done or taken and shall not be questioned on the ground of amendment of section 25 K and the
section 36 of the Act.



fagR 57T (IrATYReT), 18 dAgF«Y 2020

4. Repeal and Savings.—

)
(i)

The Industrial Disputes (Bihar Amendment) Ordinance, 2020. (Bihar Ordinance
No-07- 2020 is hereby repealed.

Notwithstanding such repeal, any thing done or any action takent in exercise of
any power conferred by or under the said ordinance shall be deemed to have been
done or taken in exercise of the powers conferred by or under this Act as if this
Act were in force on the days on which such thing was done or action taken.

By Order of the Governor of Bihar,
P.C.Choudhary,

Secretary to the Government.

Jrefters, AfAaTerd eomed,
fagIR, yeAT g1 yabIfarT ve gfadl

g TTo1e (IraTeRur) 897-571+400-SH0ET0dio|
Website: http://egazette.bih.nic.in




